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The LiftMaster gate 
system utilizes sensors that 
are embedded in our 
asphalt roads. If a vehicle 
is stopped on one of the 
ground sensors for more 
than a few minutes a safety 
feature will trigger the gate 
to remain in the open 
position until it times out 
and resets itself.  
 
If the gate does not reset 
itself and doesn’t close 
after a few minutes you 
should open the red box to 
check the power switch 
(it’s unlocked) 
 

 

 



The power switch can be 
found inside the small red 
box on the LiftMaster 
controller when you open 
the box 

 

If the gate doesn’t move 
after opening the red box 
and pressing the power 
switch, you need to look at 
the gray box adjacent to 
the LiftMaster controller. 

 

 
Open the gray box and 
look for the tiny black 
reset button.  
 
It’s located on the lower 
left side in the small box as 
shown here.  
Press the reset button and 
the gate should begin to 
close and open as normal  

 


